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Nassau County Solld Waste Department
Waest Nassau Landfill - Final Closure
Contract No, CM1734 (Bid No. NC11-004)

ALLOWANCE AUTHORIZATION
(Line ltem #4)

Issued by: Golder Agsociates Inc.

To: Comanco Environmental Corporation

Allowance Authorization No.: 04
Date: 12/20/2011

Description: The foliowing allowance is authorized:

1. Additional materials, labor, frelght, tax and equipment for the fumishing of
90' of 12" pipe and 40 Femco fittings as shown on the Isttar with backup
dated 12/6/11 (Allached), which are required to accommodate an

alternatefimproved method for the pipa hoots, $ 2 560,50

Total; 3 2,560.50
Additional Time Authorized: NA Days (Additional days must be approved by writlen Changa Ordar)

Beginning Alfowance Amount: $600,000.00
Allowance Previously Authorized: $ 292091 X 385 §F10-80
Remalning Aliowance Avallable: SETOTO0ET 4 = “‘E‘: (X -yl

LE 2 y
Amount Authorized by this Allowance: $ 2.560.50 C A

Amount Remaining: $666:440:37 4 Ski, 2T 0
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(ssuéd by: Glenn R, Carwslt [, Senlor Englneor and Assoclate Data
Golder Associates
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ngyocl b% TroyWﬁlral Project Manager FDhie
& amanco Environmental Corporation
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Approved hy:  Scoll Herring. Ditector of Public Works Data’

Nassau Counly, Florida
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Appmved by: CharlBllc?Vou ?(ﬁ iraclsAdmin frator "Date '
Nassau Cou\l F




ENVIRONMENTAL CORPORATION

December 57, 2011

Mr. Chip Carwell

Golder Associates

9428 Baymeadows Road, Suite 400
Jacksonville, FL. 32256

RE: WEST NASSAU LANDFILL CLOSURE I - Allowance Request — Alternate Pipe Boot
Method

Mr. Carwell,

The cost for COMANCO to provide additional 12" pipe (about 90°) and Femcos for the proposed
alternate pipe boot method is $2,560.50. This price includes the cost of material + tax, COMANCO
15% Mark-up and the delivery fees associnted with the material. I have attached the e-mail from
whom we received the Fernco pricing from. In regards to the pipe, we have some lefover in our shop
and are only charging what our fleet depariment charges us for freight to the job (no materiat cost).

Sincerely,

M vt

Troy WatmfS
Project Manager
COMANCO Environmental Corporation

4301 Sterling Commerce Drive = Plant City, Florida 33637 « (813) 988-8829 « FAX (813) 988-8779

www,COMANCO.com
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Thomas Raab

From: Hendershot, lames [Jamas,Hendershot@shawgrp.com]
8Sent:  Wednesday, November 23, 2011 9.38 AM

To: Thomas Raab
Subject: RE: Wast Nessau Fernco Pricing
33-12" x 8" fernco 4516ea z 145004
6-6"x 4" fernco 11.59ea « 09.5Y
1-10" x6” farnco 3343ea = 1N4%
TSI 109 17 (15 i)
| would estimate the shipping to be around 100.00 "”) = L7204h,78 + iss.my < g 956,70
thanks
James Hendershot irsreay,  MeeUp - 1,960,50
Shaw American Plastic Plpe and Supply L.L.C. -
725 South Friendship Dr, Fotwen Fey ;140 99
P) 740.826,7911 s AT T
£) 740.826.9047 A
C) 740.260,9103

From: Thomas Raab [mallto:traab@comanco.com])
Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2011 8:29 AM
To: Hendershot, James

Subjact: West Nassau Fernco Pricing

Jamas,

Could you please give me a quote for 33 EA 12 x 8 Fernco's, 6 EA 6 x 4 Femeo's and 1 EA 10 x 6 Fernco
including unft prices and frelght?

Thanks,

Thomas Raab
Project Engineer

COMANCO-Envirenmental Corporation
4301 Sterling Comimerce Drive

Plant City, FL 33568-7372

Office: (813) 988-8820 ext. 135

Fax: (813) 988-8953

E-mall: {ragh@comance com

12/5/2011
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